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The practitioner-patient relationship is fundamental to the provision of acceptable medical care. 
It is the expectation of the Board that practitioners recognize the obligations, responsibilities, and 
patient rights associated with establishing and maintaining a practitioner-patient relationship. 
Where an existing practitioner-patient relationship is not present, a practitioner must take 
appropriate steps to establish a practitioner-patient relationship consistent with the guidelines 
identified in this document, with Virginia law, and with any other applicable law.  While each 
circumstance is unique, such practitioner-patient relationships may be established using 
telemedicine services provided the standard of care is met. 

A practitioner is discouraged from rendering medical advice and/or care using telemedicine 
services without (1) fully verifying and authenticating the location and, to the extent possible, 
confirming the identity of the requesting patient; (2) disclosing and validating the practitioner’s 
identity and applicable credential(s); and (3) obtaining appropriate consents from requesting 
patients after disclosures regarding the delivery models and treatment methods or limitations, 
including any special informed consents regarding the use of telemedicine services. An 
appropriate practitioner-patient relationship has not been established when the identity of the 
practitioner may be unknown to the patient. 

A documented medical evaluation and collection of relevant clinical history commensurate with 
the presentation of the patient to establish diagnoses and identify underlying conditions and/or 
contra-indications to the treatment recommended/provided must be obtained prior to providing 
treatment, which treatment includes the issuance of prescriptions, electronically or otherwise. 
Treatment and consultation recommendations made in an online setting, including issuing a 
prescription via electronic means, will be held to the same standards of appropriate practice as 
those in traditional, in-person encounters. Treatment, including issuing a prescription based 
solely on an online questionnaire, does not constitute an acceptable standard of care. 

Prescribing controlled substances requires the establishment of a bona fide practitioner-patient 
relationship in accordance with § 54.1-3303 (A) of the Code of Virginia. Prescribing controlled 
substances, in-person or via telemedicine services, is at the professional discretion of the 
prescribing practitioner. The indication, appropriateness, and safety considerations for each 
prescription provided via telemedicine services must be evaluated by the practitioner in 
accordance with applicable law and current standards of practice and consequently carries the 
same professional accountability as prescriptions delivered during an in-person encounter. Where 
such measures are upheld, and the appropriate clinical consideration is carried out and 
documented, the practitioner may exercise their judgment and prescribe controlled substances as 
part of telemedicine encounters in accordance with applicable state and federal law. 
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Prescriptions must comply with the requirements set out in Virginia Code §§ 54.1-3408.01 and 
54.1-3303(A). Prescribing controlled substances in Schedule II through V via telemedicine also 
requires compliance with federal rules for the practice of telemedicine. Practitioners issuing 
prescriptions as part of telemedicine services should include direct contact for the prescriber or 
the prescriber’s agent on the prescription. This direct contact information ensures ease of access 
by pharmacists to clarify prescription orders, and further facilitates the prescriber-patient-
pharmacist relationship. 

SOURCE: Telemedicine Guidance. Doc. # 85-12. VA Board of Medicine. P. 1-4 (Aug. 19, 
2021). (Accessed Sept. 2021). 

A practitioner who has established a bona fide practitioner-patient relationship with a patient in 
accordance with the provisions of this subsection may prescribe Schedule II through VI 
controlled substances to that patient via telemedicine if such prescribing is in compliance with 
federal requirements for the practice of telemedicine and, in the case of the prescribing of a 
Schedule II through V controlled substance the prescriber maintains a practice at a physical 
location in the Commonwealth or is able to make appropriate referral of patients to a licensed 
practitioner located in the Commonwealth in order to ensure an in-person examination of the 
patient when required by the standard of care. 

Adds to the conditions a prescriber must meet for a bona fide practitioner-patient relationship for 
the purpose of prescribing Schedule II through VI controlled substances by an examination 
through face-to-face interactive, two-way, real-time communications services or store-and-
forward technologies. Includes: 

• The establishment of a bona fide practitioner-patient relationship via telemedicine is 
consistent with the standard of care, and the standard of care does not require an in-person 
examination for the purpose of diagnosis; and 

• The establishment of a bona fide practitioner patient relationship via telemedicine is 
consistent with federal law and regulations and any waiver thereof. 

SOURCE: VA Code Annotated 54.1-3303, (Accessed Sept. 2021). 

A prescriber may establish a bona fide practitioner-patient relationship for the purpose of 
prescribing Schedule II through VI controlled substances by an examination through face-to-face 
interactive, two-way, real-time communications services or store-and-forward technologies when 
all of the following conditions are met: (a) the patient has provided a medical history that is 
available for review by the prescriber; (b) the prescriber obtains an updated medical history at 
the time of prescribing; (c) the prescriber makes a diagnosis at the time of prescribing; (d) the 
prescriber conforms to the standard of care expected of in-person care as appropriate to the 
patient's age and presenting condition, including when the standard of care requires the use of 
diagnostic testing and performance of a physical examination, which may be carried out through 



the use of peripheral devices appropriate to the patient's condition; (e) the prescriber is actively 
licensed in the Commonwealth and authorized to prescribe; (f) if the patient is a member or 
enrollee of a health plan or carrier, the prescriber has been credentialed by the health plan or 
carrier as a participating provider and the diagnosing and prescribing meets the qualifications for 
reimbursement by the health plan or carrier pursuant to § 38.2-3418.16; (g) upon request, the 
prescriber provides patient records in a timely manner in accordance with the provisions of § 
32.1-127.1:03 and all other state and federal laws and regulations; (h) the establishment of a 
bona fide practitioner-patient relationship via telemedicine is consistent with the standard of care, 
and the standard of care does not require an in-person examination for the purpose of diagnosis; 
and (i) the establishment of a bona fide practitioner patient relationship via telemedicine is 
consistent with federal law and regulations and any waiver thereof. Nothing in this paragraph 
shall apply to (1) a prescriber providing on-call coverage per an agreement with another 
prescriber or his prescriber's professional entity or employer; (2) a prescriber consulting with 
another prescriber regarding a patient's care; or (3) orders of prescribers for hospital out-patients 
or in-patients 

Clinical Consensus 

Evidence has demonstrated that telemedicine services like telepsychiatry are just as effective as 
in-person visits.3 Further, there is clear consensus that a provider can establish a relationship with 
a patient via a telehealth visit. 

The Federation of State Medical Boards, the association of state regulators that oversees 
standards of medical care, stated that “the relationship is clearly established when the physician 
agrees to undertake diagnosis and treatment of the patient, and the patient agrees to be treated, 
whether or not there has been an encounter in person between the physician (or other 
appropriately supervised health care practitioner) and patient.”4 


